FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

18T SESSION

117TH CONGRESS S
°

To extend the authorizations for certain National Heritage Areas, and for

other purposes.

IN THE SENATE OF THE UNITED STATES

introduced the following bill; which was read twice

and referred to the Committee on

A BILL

To extend the authorizations for certain National Heritage

O o0 9 N U kA WD =

[am—
)

Areas, and for other purposes.

Be it enacted by the Senate and House of Representa-
tives of the United States of America in Congress assembled,
SECTION 1. SHORT TITLE.

This Act may be cited as the ‘“‘National Heritage
Areca Authority Extension Act of 20217,

SEC. 2. EXTENSION OF CERTAIN NATIONAL HERITAGE
AREA AUTHORITIES.

(a) ILLINOIS AND MI1CHIGAN CANAL NATIONAL HER-

ITAGE CORRIDOR.—Section 126 of the Illinois and Michi-

can Canal National Heritage Corridor Act of 1984 (54



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N D B W =

|\ I N© TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 N O B BN~ WD = ©

2
U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 98-398; 98 Stat. 1456;
120 Stat. 1853) is amended by striking “the date that
is 15 years after the date of enactment of this section”
and inserting “‘September 30, 2036,

(b) JouN H. CHAFEE BLACKSTONE RIVER VALLEY
NATIONAL HERITAGE CORRIDOR.—Section 10(a) of Pub-
lic Law 99-647 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; 100 Stat. 3630;
104 Stat. 1018; 128 Stat. 3804) is amended by striking
“2021" and inserting “2036".

(¢) DELAWARE AND LEHIGH NATIONAL HERITAGE
CORRIDOR.—Section 12 of the Delaware and ILehigh
Navigation Canal National Heritage Corridor Act of 1988
(54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 100-692; 102 Stat.
4558; 112 Stat. 3260; 123 Stat. 1293; 127 Stat. 420; 128
Stat. 314; 128 Stat. 3801) is amended—

(1) in subsection (¢)(1), by striking “2021" and
inserting “2036”"; and
(2) in subsection (d), by striking “2021”7 and

inserting “2036"".

(d) THE LAST GREEN VALLEY NATIONAL HERITAGE
CORRIDOR.—Section  106(b) of the Quinebaug and
Shetucket Rivers Valley National Heritage Corridor Act
of 1994 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 103-449;
108 Stat. 4755; 113 Stat. 1728; 123 Stat. 1291; 128



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.
3
1 Stat. 3802) is amended by striking “2021” and inserting
“2036".
(e) NATIONAL COAL HERITAGE AREA.—Section 107
of the National Coal Heritage Area Act of 1996 (54
U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat.

2
3
4
5
6 4244; 127 Stat. 420; 128 Stat. 314; 128 Stat. 3801) is
7 amended by striking “2021" and inserting “2036".

8 (f) TENNESSEE C1vi, WAR HERITAGE AREA.—Sec-
9 tion 208 of division IT of the Omnibus Parks and Public¢
10 Lands Management Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note;
11 Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4248; 127 Stat. 420; 128
12 Stat. 314; 129 Stat. 2551; 132 Stat. 661; 133 Stat. 778)
13 is amended by striking “2021”" and inserting “2036”.

14 () AUGUSTA CANAL NATIONAL HERITAGE COR-
15 RIDOR.—Section 310 of division II of the Omnibus Parks
16 and Public Lands Management Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C.
17 320101 note; Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4252; 127
18 Stat. 420; 128 Stat. 314; 129 Stat. 2551; 132 Stat. 661;
19 133 Stat. 778) is amended by striking “2021” and insert-
20 ing “2036".

21 (h) RIVERS OF STEEL NATIONAL HERITAGE

22 AREA.

Section 408 of the Steel Industry American Her-
23 itage Area Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public
24 Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4256; 127 Stat. 420; 128 Stat.



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N D Bk W

|\ I N© R NG T NS R NS R e T e T e T e T T Y
A W N = O VWV 00 N O W B~ WD = ©

4
314; 128 Stat. 3801) is amended by striking “2021" and

inserting “2036”.

(1) ESSEX NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Section 507
of division IT of the Omnibus Parks and Public Lands
Management Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public
Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4260; 127 Stat. 420; 128 Stat.
314; 128 Stat. 3801) is amended by striking “2021" and
inserting “2036”.

() SourH CAROLINA NATIONAL HERITAGE COR-
RIDOR.—Section 607 of the South Carolina National Ier-
itage Corridor Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Pub-
lic Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4264; 127 Stat. 420; 128
Stat. 314; 129 Stat. 2551; 132 Stat. 661; 133 Stat. 778)
is amended by striking “2021" and inserting “2036"".

(k) AMERICA’S AGRICULTURAL HERITAGE PARTNER-

strp.—Section 707 of division IT of the Omnibus Parks
and Public Lands Management Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C.
320101 note; Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4267; 127
Stat. 420; 128 Stat. 314; 128 Stat. 3801) is amended by
striking “2021” and inserting “2036”.

() Onro & ERIE  NATIONAL  HERITAGE
CANALWAY.—Section 809 of the Ohio & Erie Canal Na-

tional Heritage Corridor Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C. 320101
note; Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4275; 122 Stat. 826;



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N BB W =

|\ I O TR NG T NS R NS R e e T e T e T T W
A W N = O VWV 00 N O W BN~ WD = ©

5
127 Stat. 420; 128 Stat. 314; 128 Stat. 3801) is amended
by striking “2021” and inserting “2036"".

(m) MAURICE D. HINCHEY HUDSON RIVER VALLEY
NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Section 910 of the Hudson
River Valley National Heritage Area Act of 1996 (54
U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat.
4281; 127 Stat. 420; 128 Stat. 314; 128 Stat. 3801) is
amended by striking “2021"" and inserting “2036”.

(n) MOTORCITIES NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—
Section 109 of the Automobile National Heritage Area Act
(54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 105-355; 112 Stat.
3252; 128 Stat. 3802) is amended by striking “2021”" and
inserting “2036".

(0) LACKAWANNA VALLEY NATIONAL HERITAGE
AREA.—Section 108 of the Lackawanna Valley National
Heritage Area Act of 2000 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Pub-
lic Law 106-278; 114 Stat. 818; 127 Stat. 420; 128 Stat.
314; 128 Stat. 3802) is amended by striking “2021” and
inserting “2036".

(p) SCHUYLKILL RIVER VALLEY NATIONAL HERIT-
AGE AREA.—Section 209 of the Schuylkill River Valley
Heritage Area Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law
106-278; 114 Stat. 824; 128 Stat. 3802) is amended by
striking “2021”" and inserting “2036"".



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG T N T NG I NG I NS R N e T e e T e T e e
[ B N N N N = = N R < BN B e ) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

6

(q) WHEELING NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Sub-
section (1) of the Wheeling National Heritage Area Act
of 2000 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 106-291;
114 Stat. 967; 128 Stat. 3802) is amended by striking
“20217 and inserting “2036”".

(r) YUMA CROSSING NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—
Section 7 of the Yuma Crossing National Heritage Area
Act of 2000 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 106—
319; 114 Stat. 1284; 128 Stat. 3802) is amended by strik-
ing 2021”7 and inserting “2036"".

(s) ERIE CANALWAY NATIONAL HERITAGE COR-
RIDOR.—Section 811 of the Erie Canalway National Her-
itage Corridor Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law
106-554; 114 Stat. 2763A-295; 128 Stat. 3802) is
amended by striking “2021” and inserting “2036"".

(t) BLUE RIDGE NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Sub-
section (j) of the Blue Ridge National Heritage Area Act
of 2003 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 108-108;
117 Stat. 1280; 133 Stat. 778) is amended by striking
“20217 and inserting “2036”".

(u) NATIONAL AVIATION HERITAGE AREA.—Section
512 of the National Aviation Heritage Area Act (54
U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 108-447; 118 Stat.
3367; 133 Stat. 2713) is amended by striking “September
30, 20227 and inserting ‘““‘September 30, 2036,



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N W BB W =

O TN NG I N TR NG I NS N NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re < BN B e ) W ) B ~S O I NO S e

7

(v) O REGION NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Sec-
tion 608 of the Oil Region National Heritage Area Act
(54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 108-447; 118 Stat.
3372; 133 Stat. 2713) is amended by striking “September
30, 2022”7 and inserting ‘“‘September 30, 2036,

(w) NORTHERN RIO GRANDE NATIONAL HERITAGE

AREA.—Section 208 of the Northern Rio Grande National
Heritage Area Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law
109-338; 120 Stat. 1790) is amended by striking “the
date that is 15 years after the date of enactment of this
Act” and inserting “‘September 30, 2036,

(X) ATCHAFALAYA NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—
Section 221 of the Atchafalaya National Heritage Area
Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 109-338; 120
Stat. 1795) is amended by striking “the date that is 15
years after the date of enactment of this Act” and insert-
ing “September 30, 2036,

(v) ARABIA  MOUNTAIN  NATIONAL HERITAGE

AREA.—Section 240 of the Arabia Mountain National

Heritage Area Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law
109-338; 120 Stat. 1799) is amended by striking “the
date that is 15 years after the date of enactment of this
Act” and inserting “‘September 30, 2036,

(z) MORMON PIONEER NATIONAL HERITAGE

AREA.—Section 260 of the Mormon Pioneer National




FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O© o0 3 O WD B W N e

| \O 2N \© R O R \O B O B e e e e e T e e e e
A LW PO = O VOV 0 N O R WD = O

8
Heritage Area Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law

109-338; 120 Stat. 1807) is amended by striking ‘‘the
date that is 15 years after the date of enactment of this
Act” and inserting “September 30, 2036,

(aa) FREEDOM’S FRONTIER NATIONAL HERITAGE
AREA.—Section 269 of the Freedom’s Frontier National
Heritage Area Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law
109-338; 120 Stat. 1813) is amended by striking ‘‘the
date that is 15 years after the date of enactment of this
Act” and inserting ‘“September 30, 2036,

(bb) UPPER HOUSATONIC VALLEY NATIONAL HER-
ITAGE AREA.—Section 280B of the Upper Housatonic
Valley National IHeritage Area Act (54 U.S.C. 320101
note; Public Law 109-338; 120 Stat. 1819) is amended
by striking “the day occurring 15 years after the date of
the enactment of this subtitle” and inserting “September
30, 2036”.

(ce) CHAMPLAIN VALLEY NATIONAL HERITAGE
PARTNERSHIP.—Section 289 of the Champlain Valley Na-
tional Heritage Partnership Act of 2006 (54 U.S.C.
320101 note; Public Law 109-338; 120 Stat. 1824) is
amended by striking “the date that is 15 years after the
date of enactment of this Act” and inserting ‘“‘September

30, 2036



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N W BB W =

[\ TN NG I N T NG I NG R N R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) TR ~SU O I NO R e

9

(dd) GREAT BASIN NATIONAL HERITAGE ROUTE.—
Section 291J of the Great Basin National Heritage Route
Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 109-338; 120
Stat. 1831) is amended by striking “the date that is 15
yvears after the date of enactment of this Act’” and insert-
ing “September 30, 2036,

(ee) GULLAT/GEECHEE CULTURAL HERITAGE COR-
RIDOR.—Section 2951 of the Gullah/Geechee Cultural
Heritage Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 109-
338; 120 Stat. 1837) is amended by striking ‘“‘the date
that is 15 years after the date of enactment of this Act”
and inserting “‘September 30, 2036,

(ff) CROSSROADS OF THE AMERICAN REVOLUTION
NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Section 297H of the Cross-
roads of the American Revolution National Heritage Area
Act of 2006 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 109-
338; 120 Stat. 1844) is amended by striking “the date
that is 15 years after the date of enactment of this Act”
and inserting “‘September 30, 2036,

(gg) ABRAHAM LINCOLN NATIONAL HERITAGE
AREA.—Section 451 of the Consolidated Natural Re-
sources Act of 2008 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law
110-229; 122 Stat. 824) is amended by striking ‘“‘the date
that 1s 15 years after the date of the enactment of this

subtitle” and inserting ‘““‘September 30, 2036"".



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG I N T NS I NS R NS R N e T e e T e T e e T
[ B NG U N N = = N R - BN B o) W ) TR ~S O I NO I e

10

(hh) JOURNEY THrROUGH HALLOWED GROUND NA-
TIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Section 411 of the Consoli-
dated Natural Resources Act of 2008 (54 U.S.C. 320101
note; Public Law 110-229; 122 Stat. 809) is amended by
striking “‘the date that is 15 years after the date of enact-
ment of this subtitle” and inserting “September 30,
20367,

(11) NTAGARA FALLS NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—
Section 432 of the Consolidated Natural Resources Act
of 2008 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 110-229;
122 Stat. 818) is amended by striking “the date that is
15 years after the date of enactment of this Act” and in-
serting ‘“‘September 30, 2036,

(3)) KENAT MOUNTAINS-TURNAGAIN ARM NATIONAL
HERITAGE AREA.—Section 8010(1) of the Omnibus Public
Land Management Act of 2009 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note;
Public Law 111-11; 123 Stat. 1288) is amended by strik-
ing “the date that is 15 years after the date of enactment
of this Act” and inserting “‘September 30, 2036,

SEC. 3. AUTHORIZATIONS OF APPROPRIATIONS FOR CER-
TAIN NATIONAL HERITAGE AREAS.

(a) RIVERS OF STEEL NATIONAL HERITAGE
AREA.—Section 409(a) of the Steel Industry American
Heritage Area Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Pub-
lic Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4256; 129 Stat. 2551; 133



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N B W =

O TN NG N N T NG I NS I NS R N e T e e T e T e T T
[ T NG U N N = = N Re - BN B o) W ) LR ~S O I NO R e

11

Stat. 778) is amended, in the second sentence, by striking
“$20,000,000” and inserting “$22,000,000".

(b) ESSEX NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Section
508(a) of division II of the Omnibus Parks and Public
Lands Management Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note;
Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4260; 129 Stat. 2551;
133 Stat. 778) is amended, in the second sentence, by
striking “$20,000,000” and inserting “$22,000,000”.

(¢) SOUTH CAROLINA NATIONAL HERITAGE COR-
RIDOR.—Section 608(a) of the South Carolina National
Heritage Corridor Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note;
Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4264; 122 Stat. 824; 133
Stat. 2714) is amended, in the second sentence, by strik-
ing “$17,000,000” and inserting “$19,000,000”.

(d) AMERICA’S AGRICULTURAL HERITAGE PARTNER-

sHIP.—Section 708(a) of division II of the Omnibus Parks

and Public Lands Management Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C.
320101 note; Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4267; 122
Stat. 824; 134 Stat. 1505) is amended, in the second sen-
tence, by striking “$17,000,000” and inserting
“$19,000,000".

(e) Omo & ERIE NATIONAL  IHERITAGE
CANALWAY.—Section 812(a) of the Ohio & Krie Canal
National Heritage Corridor Act of 1996 (54 U.S.C.
320101 note; Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat. 4275; 133



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N W Bk W =

|\ I NO TR NG T NS R NS R L e T e T e D e e T
A LW N = O VWV 00 N O W BN~ WD = ©

12
Stat. 778) is amended by striking “$20,000,000” and in-
serting “$22,000,000”.

(f) MAURICE D. HINCHEY HUDSON RIVER VALLEY
NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Section 909(¢) of the Hud-
son River Valley National Heritage Area Act of 1996 (54
U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 104-333; 110 Stat.
4280; 122 Stat. 824) is amended, in the matter preceding
paragraph (1), by striking “$15,000,000” and inserting
“$17,000,000".

(¢) MOTORCITIES NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—
Section 110(a) of the Automobile National Heritage Area
Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 105-355; 112
Stat. 3252; 133 Stat. 778) is amended, in the second sen-
tence, by striking “$12,000,000” and inserting
“$14,000,000".

(h) WHEELING NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Sub-
section (h)(1) of the Wheeling National Heritage Area Act
of 2000 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 106-291;
114 Stat. 967; 133 Stat. 778) is amended by striking
“$15,000,000” and inserting “$17,000,000”.

(i) ERIE CANALWAY NATIONAL HERITAGE COR-
RIDOR.—Section 810(a)(1) of the Erie Canalway National
Heritage Corridor Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public
Law 106-554; 114 Stat. 2763A-303; 131 Stat. 461; 133



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N W BB W=

|\ I N© R NG T NS R NS R L e e T e T e e e T
A W N = O VWV 00 NN O B B~ WD = ©

13
Stat. 2714) is amended by striking “$14,000,000” and
inserting “$16,000,000”.

(j) ILLINOIS AND MICHIGAN CANAL NATIONAL HER-
ITAGE CORRIDOR.—Section 125(a) of the Illinois and
Michigan Canal National Heritage Corridor Act of 1984
(54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 98-398; 98 Stat.
1456; 120 Stat. 1853) is amended by striking
“$10,000,000” and inserting “$12,000,000”.

(k) THE LAST GREEN VALLEY NATIONAL HERITAGE
CORRIDOR.—Section 109(a) of the Quinebaug and
Shetucket Rivers Valley National Heritage Corridor Act
of 1994 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 103-449;
108 Stat. 4756; 113 Stat. 1729; 123 Stat. 1292; 133
Stat. 2714) is amended, in the first sentence, by striking
“$17,000,000” and inserting “$19,000,000”.

(I) LACKAWANNA VALLEY NATIONAL HERITAGE
AREA.—Section 109(a) of the Lackawanna Valley Na-
tional Heritage Area Act of 2000 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note;
Public Law 106-278; 114 Stat. 818; 134 Stat. 1505) is
amended by striking “$12,000,000” and inserting
“$14,000,000".

(m) SCHUYLKILL RIVER VALLEY NATIONAL HERIT-
AGE AREA.—Section 210(a) of the Schuylkill River Valley

National Heritage Area Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Pub-



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O o0 N N B W

[\O T \© R (O R R e e e e e e e T
DN = O 00NN R WD = O

14
lic Law 106-278; 114 Stat. 824) is amended by striking
“$10,000,000” and inserting “$12,000,000”.

(n) BLUE RIDGE NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—Sub-
section (1)(1) of the Blue Ridge National Heritage Area
Act of 2003 (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public Law 108-
108; 117 Stat. 1280; 133 Stat. 778) is amended by strik-
ing “$14,000,000” and inserting “$16,000,000”.

SEC. 4. EXTENSION OF CERTAIN NATIONAL HERITAGE AND
CULTURAL HERITAGE CORRIDOR COMMIS-
SIONS.

(a) ERIE CANALWAY NATIONAL HERITAGE COR-
RIDOR  COMMISSION.—Section  804(j) of the Erie
Canalway National IHeritage Corridor Act (54 U.S.C.
320101 note; Public Law 106-554; 114 Stat. 2763A-299;
123 Stat. 1294; 128 Stat. 3802) is amended by striking
“20217 and inserting “2036”.

(b) GULLAI/GEECHEE CULTURAL HERITAGE COR-
RIDOR COMMISSION.—Section 295D(d) of the Gullah/
Geechee Cultural Heritage Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note;
Public Law 109-338; 120 Stat. 1833; 130 Stat. 962) is
amended by striking “15 years after the date of enactment

of this Act” and inserting “on September 30, 2036,



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

15

1 SEC. 5. EXTENSION OF DEADLINE TO COMPLETE CERTAIN

NolNe B e N, .~ L OV R \O)

[\ TR NO T N R NG T NG I N R NS R S e e T e e e Y e T
A N A WD = O O 0NN B WD —= O

MANAGEMENT PLANS.

Section 6001(¢)(1) of the John D. Dingell, Jr. Con-

servation, Management, and Recreation Act (54 U.S.C.

320101 note; Public Law 116-9; 133 Stat. 772) is amend-

[13=%2]

ed by striking “3”" and inserting “5”".

SEC. 6. REDESIGNATION OF HERITAGE AREAS.

(a) SILOS & SMOKESTACKS NATIONAL HERITAGE

AREA.—

(1) REDESIGNATION.—The America’s Agricul-
tural Heritage Partnership established by section
703(a) of division II of the Ommnibus Parks and Pub-
lic Lands Management Act of 1996 (Public Law
104-333; 110 Stat. 4266) shall be known and des-
ignated as the “Silos & Smokestacks National Herit-
age Area’’.

(2) REFERENCES.—Any reference in a law,

map, regulation, document, paper, or other record of
the United States to the partnership referred to in
subsection (a) shall be deemed to be a reference to
the “Silos & Smokestacks National Heritage Area’ .
(b) GREAT BASIN NATIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—

(1) DESIGNATION OF THE GREAT BASIN NA-
TIONAL HERITAGE AREA.—The Great Basin Na-
tional Heritage Route Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note;
Public Law 109-338; 120 Stat. 1824) is amended—



FLO21C77 334

S.L.C.

16
1 (A) by striking “the Heritage Route” each
2 place it appears and inserting ‘“‘the IHeritage
3 Area’”’;
4 (B) by striking ‘“‘along” each place it ap-
5 pears and inserting “in’’;
6 (C) in the subtitle heading, by striking
7 “Route’” and inserting “Area’’;
8 (D) in section 291, by striking ‘“‘Route”
9 and inserting “Area’’;
10 (E) mn section 291A(a)—
11 (1) in paragraphs (2) and (3), by
12 striking “‘the Great Basin Heritage Route”
13 each place it appears and inserting ‘‘the
14 Great Basin National Heritage Area’; and
15 (ii) in paragraph (13), by striking “a
16 Heritage Route” and inserting “‘a Heritage
17 Area’’;
18 (F) in section 291B, by striking paragraph
19 (2) and inserting the following:
20 “(2) HERITAGE AREA.—The term ‘Heritage
21 Area’ means the Great Basin National Heritage
22 Area established by section 291C(a).”’;
23 (G) n section 291C—
24 (i) in the section heading, by striking
25 “ROUTE” and inserting “AREA”’; and



FLO21C77 334 S.L.C.

O© 00 3 O WD A W N e

e T = O =
W NN = O

17
(1) in subsection (a), by striking
“Heritage Route” and inserting “‘Heritage
Area”’; and
(IT) in section 2911.i(d), in the subsection
heading, by striking “IN HERITAGE ROUTE”
and inserting “IN HERITAGE AREA”.

(2) DESIGNATION OF GREAT BASIN HERITAGE
AREA PARTNERSHIP.—The Great Basin National
Heritage Area Act (54 U.S.C. 320101 note; Public
Law 109-338; 120 Stat. 1824) is amended by strik-
ing “Great Basin Heritage Route Partnership” each
place it appears and inserting “Great Basin Herit-

age Area Partnership”.



